
Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
FIRST JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Elaine Richbourg, Court Reporter 

 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $40.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $25.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    Same as Appearance Fee above   
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  Same as Appearance Fee above 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    Same as Appearance Fee above   
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  Same as Appearance Fee above 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $50.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.50 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $5.50 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $4.50 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $4.00 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.25 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.30 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid     
 
Transcription from tapes                 $40 first hour, $25 each hour after first 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $4.00 per page 
 
Video Services      No bid 
 
Video Conferences     $40 first hour, $25 each hour after first 
 
Weekends and State Holidays, Court hearings   
Trials/DOAH/Board & Public Meetings   $50 per hour 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
SECOND JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
 
First (1st)  For the Record Reporting
 
Second (2nd)  Accurate Stenotype Reporters, Inc. 
 
Appearance Fee:     For the Record  Accurate Stenotype 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $40.00 per hour  $75.00 per hour  
Each hour after first     $25.00 per hour  $50.00 per hour  
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $150.00 full day  Same as above  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $75.00 half day  Same as above 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $30.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $150.00 full day  $600.00 full day  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $75.00 half day  $300.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $30.00 per hour  $75.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $10.00 per hour  $75.00 first hour 

$50.00 each hour after  
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.85 per page  $3.20 per page  
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $7.50 per page  $6.00 per page  
 
72 hours delivery      $5.50 per page  $5.00 per page  

 
5 day delivery      $4.50 per page  $4.00 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.85 per page  $2.25 per page  
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page  $0.50 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     $75.00 per hour  $90.00 per hour 
 
Key word indexing     No bid   No bid 

 
Key word indexing     No bid          $1.00 per page  
 
Transcription from tapes                 $50.00 per hour  $70.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $5.00 per page  $6.00 per page 
 
Video Services      $100.00 per hour $150.00 per hour 
 
Video Conferencing     $150.00 per hour $175.00 per hour 

 
Weekends and State Holidays, Court hearings  No Bid        $100.00 per hour 
 
Trials/DOAH/Board & Public Meetings   No Bid   $450.00 half day 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
THIRD JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Third Circuit Reporters & Video 

 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $50.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $30.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $230.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $115.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $60.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $230.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $115.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $60.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $10.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.85 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $7.50 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $5.95 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $4.95 per page 
 
Additional copies     $2.00 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.40 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     $75.00 per hour 
 
Key word indexing     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid                   
 
Transcription from tapes                 $50.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $5.00 per page 

 
Video Services      $100.00 per hour 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
FOURTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Statewide Reporting Service 
 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $50.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $32.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $260.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $130.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $60.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $360.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $180.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $90.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $4.35 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $9.50 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $8.00 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $5.50 per page 
 
Additional copies     $2.50 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.45 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     $45.00 per hour 
 
Key word indexing     $0.07 per word 
 
Key word indexing     $15.00 per page     
 
Transcription from tapes                 $30.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $4.95 per page 
 
Video Services      $190.00 per hour 
 
Video Conferencing     $190.00 per hour 
 
Weekends, State holidays, for DOAH     $60.00 per hour 
 
Court hearings/trials/Board and Public meetings  $200 per half day 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
FIFTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
NO CONTRACTOR AT THIS TIME   
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour            
Each hour after first           
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)          
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)         
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Real-time reporting, per hour     

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)          
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24-hour delivery            
 
72 hours delivery            

 
5 day delivery`       
 
Additional copies          
 
Exhibits        
 
Telephone Reporting      
 
Key word indexing      
 
Key word indexing          
 
Transcription from tapes      
 
Transcription from tapes 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
SIXTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Bay Park Reporting 
 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $45.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $20.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $148.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $104.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $25.50 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $224.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $152.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $25.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $125.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.40 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $6.55 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $5.50 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $4.45 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.75 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     No Bid             
 
Key word indexing     No Bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.25 per page     
 
Transcription from tapes                 $20.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $4.25 per page 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
SEVENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Volusia Reporting Company 
 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $60.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $30.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $250.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $125.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $45.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $400.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $200.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $75.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.80 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $7.00 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $6.00 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $5.25 per page 
 
Additional copies     $2.25 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     $60.00 per hour 
 
Key word indexing     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     $1.00 per page     
 
Transcription from tapes                 $30.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $6.00 per page 
 
Video Services          $150.00 per hour 
 
Video Conferencing     $150.00 per hour 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
EIGHT JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
LeBlanc Court Reporting, Inc. 
 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $40.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $25.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    Same as Above        
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  Same as Above     
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $25.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $375.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $190.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $70.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $70.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.40 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $6.80 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $5.10 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $4.25 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.50 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.30 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     No Charge          
 
Key word indexing     No Charge 
 
Key word indexing     No Charge             
 
Transcription from tapes                 No Charge       
 
Transcription from tapes                 $3.50 per page 
 
Video Services      $100 per hour 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
NINTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
American Court Reporting                

 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $40.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $20.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $180.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $100.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $30.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $215.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $120.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $30.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $175.00 first hour 

$100.00 each hour after first 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.00 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $6.00 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $5.00 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $4.00 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.00 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.35 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     No Bid              
 
Key word indexing     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid     
 
Transcription from tapes                 No Bid              
 
Transcription from tapes     No Bid 
 
Video Services      No Bid 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
TENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
NO CONTRACTOR AT THIS TIME 
 
SERVICES      

 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour           
Each hour after first      
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)          
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)         
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Real-time reporting, per hour     

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)          
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24-hour delivery       
 
72 hours delivery            

 
5 day delivery`       
 
Additional copies          
 
Exhibits        
 
Telephone Reporting      
 
Key word indexing      
 
Key word indexing          
 
Transcription from tapes 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
ELEVENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
 

First (1st) Official Reporting Service  
 
Second (2nd) Kaplan Soderberg & Associates, Inc.    
 

 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $50.00 per hour  $60.00 per hour  
Each hour after first     $25.00 per hour  $30.00 per hour  
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $250.00 full day  $300.00 per hour  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $125.00 half day $150.00 per hour  
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour  $45.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $400.00 full day  $350.00 per hour  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $200.00 half day $175.00 per hour 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour  $45.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $75.00 per hour  $70.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $2.95 per page  $3.55 per page  
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $7.00 per page  $7.10 per page 
 
72 hours delivery      $6.00 per page  $5.33 per page  

 
5 day delivery`      $5.00 per page  $4.62 per page 

 
Additional copies     $1.00 per page  $1.50 per page  
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page  No bid 
 
Telephone Reporting     $40.00 per hour  No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid   No bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.25 per page  No bid   
 
Transcription from tapes                 $35.00 per hour  No bid   
 
Transcription from tapes                 $3.00 per page  No bid 
 
Video services      $100.00 per hour No bid 

 11 



Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
TWELFTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Bay Park Reporting  
 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $45.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $20.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $148.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $104.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $25.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $224.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $152.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $25.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $125.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.40 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $6.55 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $5.50 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $4.45 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.75 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     No bid          
 
Key word indexing     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.25 per page     
 
Transcription from tapes                 $20.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $4.25 per page 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
THIRTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
 
First (1st)  Bay Park Reporting  
 
Second (2nd)  Berryhill & Associates    
    
 
SERVICES      Bay Park   Berryhill
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $45.00 per hour   $55.00 per hour 
Each hour after first     $20.00 per hour   $55.00 per hour 
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $144.00 full day   Same as above 
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $ 96.00 half day   Same as above 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $ 25.00 per hour  Not applicable 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $224.00 full day   Same as above 
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $152.00 half day  Same as above 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $ 25.00 per hour  Not applicable 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $125.00 per hour  $75.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.05 per page   $3.95 per page 
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy       
24 hour delivery      $6.15 per page   $7.90 per page 
 
72 hours delivery      $5.60 per page   $6.00 per page 

 
5 day delivery`      $4.30 per page   $5.00 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.75 per page   $1.00 per page 
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page   $0.10 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     No Bid    No Bid 
 
Key word indexing     No Bid    No Bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.25 per page   No Charge 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $20.00 per hour   $55.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $4.25 per page   Same as above 
 
Video services      No Bid    No Bid 
 
Court hearings/trials/doah/board/public meetings 
per hour      No Bid    $82.50 per hour 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
FOURTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
NO CONTRACTOR AT THIS TIME 

 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour           
Each hour after first      
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)          
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)         
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Real-time reporting, per hour     

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)          
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24-hour delivery       
 
72 hours delivery            

 
5 day delivery`       
 
Additional copies          
 
Exhibits        
 
Telephone Reporting      
 
Key word indexing      
 
Key word indexing          
 
Transcription from tapes      
 
Transcription from tapes      
 
Video services       
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
FIFTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
 
First (1st) Official Reporting Service  
 
Second (2nd) Kaplan Soderberg & Associates, Inc.  
   
 
       Official  Kaplan   

 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $50.00 per hour  $60.00 per hour  
Each hour after first     $25.00 per hour  $30.00 per hour  
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $250.00 full day  $300.00 per hour  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $125.00 half day $150.00 per hour  
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour  $45.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $400.00 full day  $350.00 per hour  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $200.00 half day $175.00 per hour 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour  $45.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $75.00 per hour  $70.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $2.95 per page  $3.55 per page  
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $7.00 per page  $7.10 per page 
 
72 hours delivery      $6.00 per page  $5.33 per page  

 
5 day delivery`      $5.00 per page  $4.62 per page 

 
Additional copies     $1.00 per page  $1.50 per page  
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page  No bid 
 
Telephone Reporting     $40.00 per hour  No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid   No bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.25 per page  No bid   
 
Transcription from tapes                 $35.00 per hour  No bid   
 
Transcription from tapes                 $3.00 per page  No bid 
 
Video services      $100.00 per hour No bid 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
SIXTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
NO CONTRACTOR AT THIS TIME 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour           
Each hour after first      
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)          
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)         
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Real-time reporting, per hour     

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)          
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24-hour delivery       
 
72 hours delivery            

 
5 day delivery`       
 
Additional copies          
 
Exhibits        
 
Telephone Reporting      
 
Key word indexing      
 
Key word indexing          
 
Transcription from tapes      
 
Transcription from tapes      
 
Video services 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
SEVENTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
 
First (1st) Official Reporting Service  
 
Second (2nd) Kaplan Soderberg & Associates, Inc. 
    
 
       Official  Kaplan   

 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $50.00 per hour  $60.00 per hour  
Each hour after first     $25.00 per hour  $30.00 per hour  
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $250.00 full day  $300.00 per hour  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $125.00 half day $150.00 per hour  
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour  $45.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $400.00 full day  $350.00 per hour  
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $200.00 half day $175.00 per hour 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour  $45.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $75.00 per hour  $70.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $2.95 per page  $3.55 per page  
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $7.00 per page  $7.10 per page 
 
72 hours delivery      $6.00 per page  $5.33 per page  

 
5 day delivery`      $5.00 per page  $4.62 per page 

 
Additional copies     $1.00 per page  $1.50 per page  
 
Exhibits       $0.50 per page  No bid 
 
Telephone Reporting     $40.00 per hour  No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid   No bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.25 per page  No bid   
 
Transcription from tapes                 $35.00 per hour  No bid   
 
Transcription from tapes                 $3.00 per page  No bid 
 
Video services      $100.00 per hour No bid 
 
 

 

 17 



Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
EIGHTEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
NO CONTRACTOR AT THIS TIME 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour            
Each hour after first           
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)          
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)         
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)   
Overtime for full and half day, per hour    
 
Real-time reporting, per hour     

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)          
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24-hour delivery            
 
72 hours delivery            

 
5 day delivery`       
 
Additional copies          
 
Exhibits        
 
Telephone Reporting      
 
Key word indexing      
 
Key word indexing          
 
Transcription from tapes      
 
Transcription from tapes 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
NINETEENTH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Atlantic Reporting, Inc. 
 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $50.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $40.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $360.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $180.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $67.50 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $400.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $200.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $75.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $95.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $4.00 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $8.00 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $6.00 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $5.00 per page 
 
Additional copies     $2.50 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.40 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     $50.00 per hour 
 
Key word indexing     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.50 per page     
 
Transcription from tapes                 $50.00 per hour 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $4.00 per page 
 
Video Services      $275.00 two-hour minimum, then $90.00 per hour 
 
Court hearings/DOAH/Trials weekends & holidays $100 per hour, $270 per half day 
 
Board & Public Meetings weekends & holidays  $100 per hour, $300 per half day 
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Court Reporters 
List of Vendors and Fees 

Valid through June 30, 2008 
 

 

 
TWENTIETH JUDICIAL CIRCUIT 

 
Martina Reporting Services, Inc. 
 
 
Appearance Fee: 
(8:00am-5:00pm, Mon thru Fri) 
First Hour      $40.00 per hour     
Each hour after first     $32.00 per hour     
 
Court Hearings/Trials/DOAH Hearings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $300.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $150.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $20.00 per hour 
 
Board and Public Meetings 
Full day (8:00am - 5:30pm)    $340.00 full day     
Half day (8:00am -12:00pm & 1:00pm - 5:00pm)  $170.00 half day 
Overtime for full and half day, per hour   $20.00 per hour 
 
Real-time reporting, per hour    $60.00 per hour 

 
Transcript Fee: Original & one copy 
(10 working days delivery)    $3.95 per page     
 
Expedited Transcript Fees: Original & one copy 
24 hour delivery      $7.90 per page     
 
72 hours delivery      $5.93 per page     

 
5-day delivery`      $4.50 per page 
 
Additional copies     $1.50 per page     
 
Exhibits       $0.25 per page 
 
Telephone Reporting     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     No bid 
 
Key word indexing     $0.25 per page     
 
Transcription from tapes     No bid 
 
Transcription from tapes                 $5.50 per page 
 
Video services      $185.00 per hour 

$80.00 per hour for each hour after first 
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